

IFB#S15-001 FLEET VEHICLES

OPENING 10/3/14

VENDOR NAME:

RELIABLE CHEVROLET

City of Leander Vehicle Bid Tabulation FY 14/15

ITEM #	NEW OR REPLACEMENT	VEHICLE DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	MAKE	MODEL	YEAR ('13, '14 or '15)	DAYS TO DELIVER	VEHICLE PRICE
#1 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$29,887.74
#2 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$29,887.74
#3 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$29,887.74
#4 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$29,887.74
#5 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$29,887.74
#6 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$29,887.74
#7 PD	NEW	Mid-sized SUV - 4-door, Grey						NO BID
#8 PW/ENG	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 4WD - White						\$28,278.89
#9 PW	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 2WD - White						\$26,019.50
#10 PW	NEW	3/4 Ton Pick-up Truck, 2-Door Regular Cab and Utility Bed - White						\$29,246.10
#11 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						NO BID
#12 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						NO BID

ALT
\$36,590.10

IFB#S15-001 FLEET VEHICLES

OPENING 10/3/14

VENDOR NAME:

Chadwell Company

City of Leander Vehicle Bid Tabulation FY 14/15

ITEM #	NEW OR REPLACEMENT	VEHICLE DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	MAKE	MODEL	YEAR ('13, '14 or '15)	DAYS TO DELIVER	VEHICLE PRICE
#1 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$29,116.00
#2 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$29,116.00
#3 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$29,116.00
#4 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$29,116.00
#5 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$29,116.00
#6 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$29,116.00
#7 PD	NEW	Mid-sized SUV - 4-door, Grey						NO BID
#8 PW/ENG	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 4WD - White						\$29,013.00
#9 PW	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 2WD - White						\$25,842.00
#10 PW	NEW	3/4 Ton Pick-up Truck, 2-Door Regular Cab and Utility Bed - White						\$24,872.00
#11 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						NO BID
#12 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						NO BID

ALT.
\$31,673.00

IFB#S15-001 FLEET VEHICLES

OPENING 10/3/14

VENDOR NAME: MEADOR DODGE

City of Leander Vehicle Bid Tabulation FY 14/15

ITEM #	NEW OR REPLACEMENT	VEHICLE DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	MAKE	MODEL	YEAR ('13, '14 or '15)	DAYS TO DELIVER	VEHICLE PRICE
#1 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#2 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#3 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#4 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#5 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#6 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#7 PD	NEW	Mid-sized SUV - 4-door, Grey						\$26,439.00
#8 PW/ENG	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 4WD - White						\$26,369.00
#9 PW	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 2WD - White						\$23,950.00
#10 PW	NEW	3/4 Ton Pick-up Truck, 2-Door Regular Cab and Utility Bed - White						\$28,900.00
#11 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						\$26,658.00
#12 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						\$26,658.00

ALT
NO BID

IFB#S15-001 FLEET VEHICLES

OPENING 10/3/14

VENDOR NAME:

GRAPEVINE CHRYSLER SEED + DODGE

City of Leander Vehicle Bid Tabulation FY 14/15

ITEM #	NEW OR REPLACEMENT	VEHICLE DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	MAKE	MODEL	YEAR ('13, '14 or '15)	DAYS TO DELIVER	VEHICLE PRICE
#1 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#2 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#3 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#4 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#5 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#6 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#7 PD	NEW	Mid-sized SUV - 4-door, Grey						\$26,439. ⁰⁰
#8 PW/ENG	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 4WD - White						\$25,906. ⁰⁰
#9 PW	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 2WD - White						\$23,609. ⁰⁰
#10 PW	NEW	3/4 Ton Pick-up Truck, 2-Door Regular Cab and Utility Bed - White						\$27,040. ⁰⁰
#11 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						\$25,507. ⁰⁰
#12 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						\$25,507. ⁰⁰

ALT
\$ NO BID

IFB#S15-001 FLEET VEHICLES

OPENING 10/3/14

VENDOR NAME:

SILSBEE FORD

City of Leander Vehicle Bid Tabulation FY 14/15

ITEM #	NEW OR REPLACEMENT	VEHICLE DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	MAKE	MODEL	YEAR ('13, '14 or '15)	DAYS TO DELIVER	VEHICLE PRICE
#1 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#2 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#3 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#4 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#5 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#6 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#7 PD	NEW	Mid-sized SUV - 4-door, Grey						NO BID
#8 PW/ENG	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 4WD - White						\$26,160. ⁰⁰
#9 PW	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 2WD - White						\$29,231. ⁰⁰
#10 PW	NEW	3/4 Ton Pick-up Truck, 2-Door Regular Cab and Utility Bed - White						\$26,471. ⁰⁰
#11 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						NO BID
#12 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						NO BID

AUT
 \$33,728.⁻
 JF

IFB#S15-001 FLEET VEHICLES

OPENING 10/3/14

VENDOR NAME:

Prestige Ford

City of Leander Vehicle Bid Tabulation FY 14/15

ITEM #	NEW OR REPLACEMENT	VEHICLE DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	MAKE	MODEL	YEAR ('13, '14 or '15)	DAYS TO DELIVER	VEHICLE PRICE
#1 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$25,500. ⁰⁰
#2 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$25,500. ⁰⁰
#3 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$25,500.-
#4 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$25,500.-
#5 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$25,500
#6 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						\$25,500
#7 PD	NEW	Mid-sized SUV - 4-door, Grey						\$26,200.- \$25,500.-
#8 PW/ENG	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 4WD - White						\$29,400.- \$28,000.-
#9 PW	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 2WD - White						\$26,400.- \$25,100.-
#10 PW	NEW	3/4 Ton Pick-up Truck, 2-Door Regular Cab and Utility Bed - White						\$25,200
#11 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						\$30,400
#12 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						\$30,400

OUT
\$31,600.⁰⁰

IFB#S15-001 FLEET VEHICLES

OPENING 10/3/14

VENDOR NAME:

GRUPPITI FLEET SERVICE

City of Leander Vehicle Bid Tabulation FY 14/15

ITEM #	NEW OR REPLACEMENT	VEHICLE DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	MAKE	MODEL	YEAR ('13, '14 or '15)	DAYS TO DELIVER	VEHICLE PRICE
#1 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						100 BID
#2 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						100 BID
#3 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						100 BID
#4 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						100 BID
#5 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						100 BID
#6 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						100 BID
#7 PD	NEW	Mid-sized SUV - 4-door, Grey						100 BID
#8 PW/ENG	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 4WD - White						\$29,249.61
#9 PW	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 2WD - White						\$26,173.01
#10 PW	NEW	3/4 Ton Pick-up Truck, 2-Door Regular Cab and Utility Bed - White						\$25,694.25
#11 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						100 BID
#12 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						100 BID

ALT
\$32,507.93

IFB#S15-001 FLEET VEHICLES

OPENING 10/3/14

VENDOR NAME: AutoBay Dodge

City of Leander Vehicle Bid Tabulation FY 14/15

ITEM #	NEW OR REPLACEMENT	VEHICLE DESCRIPTION	VENDOR	MAKE	MODEL	YEAR ('13, '14 or '15)	DAYS TO DELIVER	VEHICLE PRICE
#1 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#2 PD	NEW	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#3 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#4 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#5 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#6 PD	REPLACEMENT	PPV 2WD SUV - White						NO BID
#7 PD	NEW	Mid-sized SUV - 4-door, Grey						\$26,805
#8 PW/ENG	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 4WD - White						NO BID
#9 PW	NEW	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab, 2WD - White						NO BID
#10 PW	NEW	3/4 Ton Pick-up Truck, 2-Door Regular Cab and Utility Bed - White						NO BID
#11 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						\$27,174.00
#12 FIRE	REPLACEMENT	1/2 Ton Pick-Up Truck with 4-Door Crew Cab - Red Special Service Vehicle (SSV) Package, 4x4						\$27,174.00

ACT
NO BID